
FAQ’s

How do I get there?

Sundown Cinema is located in the car park of Penrith Homemaker Centre. 
We are located on the Cnr Mulgoa Rd & Wolseley Street, Jamisontown 
2749. We encourage all guests to park in the undercover car park - Drive 
through the Patty’s Place entry and turn right at the round-a-bout. Drive 
straight towards Fantastic Furniture and head down the ramp to park 
undercover. 

What time does the pre-movie entertainment & film start?

The pre-movie entertainment will commence from 5:00pm. The screening 
will commence at approx. 7:00pm depending on sunset. We suggest 
arriving early to ensure a great spot. Give yourself time to relax and enjoy 
a bite to eat before the film.

Can I BYO?

BYO alcohol is not permitted at Sundown Cinema Penrith Homemaker 
Centre. However, you are welcome to bring your own snacks. We will 
have a series of food trucks onsite for food purchases. 

What should I wear/bring?

Sundown Cinema is an outdoor cinema, and it can get chilly once the sun 
goes down! Be prepared and pack a jumper just in case. The car park will 
be lined with AstroTurf - we recommend you bring a picnic rug, fold out 
chairs or pillows.

Where can I park?

Undercover parking is available at Penrith Homemaker Centre. Drive 
through the Patty’s Place entry and turn right at the round-a-bout. Drive 
straight towards Fantastic Furniture and head down the ramp to park 
undercover. 
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FAQ’s Continued

What are the seating arrangements?

BYO bean bags, low beach chairs, cushions, blankets and rugs! If you need 
to bring a full height chair, please consider your fellow guests and be aware 
that we may ask you to move to the side or back of the seating area.

What food and drinks are available?

There will be a series of food trucks at the event, including Rolling Schnitzel 
& G-Dup Burgers, providing a delicious range of meals, snacks and hot and 
cold drinks.

How much do tickets cost?

Nothing! Zero! It’s FREE! The only cost will be from your purchases from the 
various food trucks.  

What if it rains?

As an outdoor event Sundown Cinema is subject to weather. We will try to 
go ahead with screenings wherever possible, and will not cancel for 
light/intermittent/potential rain. We strongly recommend you bring wet 
weather gear in case of rain.

The event will be cancelled only if the weather poses a safety threat to 
patrons and staff. We will aim to cancel as early as possible, however as 
weather conditions are unpredictable we may have to cancel close to or 
during the screening. 

We will post a notification on Facebook. In addition, signage will be erected 
on site. 

Have another question? Call us on 02 4737 9800
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